



BID TABULATION

Invitation for Bids for the Purchase, Delivery and Installation of Aquatics Filtration Systems for the City of Brownsville Parks and Recreations Department

BID # AFS-17-0217

Monday, February 14, 2017 at 3:00 P.M.

Vendors:	Progressive Commercial Aquatics 15616 Schmidt Loop Manor, TX 78653 Ph. #: 1-949-606-5869 Fax #: N/A	Sunbelt Pools, Inc. 10555 Plano Road Dallas, TX 75238-1305 Ph. #: 1-214-343-1133 Fax #: N/A	Recreonics, Inc. 4200 Schmitt Ave. Louisville, KY 40213 Ph. #: 1-800-428-3254 Fax #: 1-800-428-0133
Purchase and Delivery of Aquatics Filtration System	Unit Price:	Unit Price	Unit Price:
Horizontal Commercial Filtration System - Sams Large Pool	\$100,134.50 (Neptune)	\$118,000.00 (Neptune)	\$27,893.68
Horizontal Commercial Filtration System Option # 2	Unit Price: \$89,741.15 (Waterco)	N/A	N/A
Alternate # 1 Sams Large Pool	\$7,000.00	\$28,000.00	No Bid
Alternate # 2 Sams Large Pool	Included	\$36,000.00	No Bid
Alternate # 3 Sams Large Pool	Included	\$6,500.00	No Bid
Alternate # 4 Sams Large Pool	Included	\$5,500.00	No Bid

Horizontal Commercial Filtration System - Sams Small Pool	\$71,953.35 (Neptune)	\$87,000.00 (Neptune)	\$23,546.71
Horizontal Commercial Filtration System – Sams Small Pool Option # 2	\$61,629.13 (Waterco)	N/A	N/A
Alternate # 1 – Sams Small Pool	\$6,000.00	\$20,000.00	No Bid
Alternate # 2 – Sams Small Pool	Included	\$28,000.00	No Bid
Alternate # 3 – Sams Small Pool	Included	\$3,000.00	No Bid
Horizontal Commercial Filtration System - Oliveira Pool	\$77,932.91 (Waterco)	\$98,000.00 (Neptune)	\$26,976.65
Alternate # 1 – Oliveira Pool	\$6,000.00	\$18,000.00	No Bid
Alternate # 2 – Oliveira Pool	Included	Included	No Bid
Alternate # 3 – Oliveira Pool	Included	\$3,000.00	No Bid
Horizontal Commercial Filtration System - Gonzalez Pool	\$90,165.41 (Neptune)	\$98,000.00 (Neptune)	\$26,976.65
Horizontal Commercial Filtration System - Gonzalez Pool Option # 2	\$83,535.09 (Waterco)	N/A	N/A
Alternate # 1 – Gonzalez Pool	\$6,000.00	\$18,000.00	No Bid

Alternate # 2 – Gonzalez Park	Included	Included	No Bid
Alternate # 3 – Gonzalez Park	Included	\$3,500.00	No Bid
Sams Splash Pad System	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alternate # 1 – Sams Splash Pad System	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alternate # 2 – Sams Splash Pad System	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alternate # 3 – Sams Splash Pad System	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Addendum Acknowledged:	Yes	Yes	Yes
Specification Criteria:	Responsive and responsible	Responsive and responsible	Responsive and responsible Lowest Bidder